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Truck & Trailer Components wins ‘Supplier of the Year’ at the 
IFA awards 2010

Truck & Trailer Components (TTC) have been awarded ‘Supplier of the Year’ at this year’s 
Independent Motor Trade Factors Association (IFA) Supplier awards.

Presented at the IFA annual conference in Carden Park, near Chester on Saturday 13th

November, the award recognises TTC’s performance across a broad range of areas including 
product availability and delivery, sales and marketing support, inventory support and the level 
of customer service provided by TTC to its customers.

The TTC team have recently developed a number of innovative customer programmes; 
including expanding its same day delivery service and online business system which, 
available via the TTC website, provides customers with a whole range of e-commerce tools 
including on-line ordering, electronic catalogues, cross references, along with the latest TTC 
product news and promotions. 

This is the second consecutive year that TTC have won this award, a fantastic accolade for
the TTC business and recognises the company’s focus on the Commercial Vehicle market 
and customers. 

TTC General Manager, Darren Miller, said: 

“This is a fantastic achievement for the TTC business and recognises the company’s 
continuous investment in logistics and e-commerce trading. This is further supported by our 
continued focus and development of the TTC product range and brand propositions to help 
deliver outstanding customer service. The TTC business is built on customer support and the 
team has worked extremely hard to develop this relationship.

TTC distributes to a network of Independent Factors in the UK and Eire, as well as serving a 
growing worldwide export market. 

For more information please visit www.ttcuk.co.uk or email emma_anderson@unipart.co.uk
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Editors notes: 
TTC is part of the Unipart Group, which employs more than 10,000 personnel worldwide and 
has an annual turnover of more than £1billion. It is a leading full service logistics provider and 
consultant in operational excellence operating across a range of market sectors, including 
automotive, leisure, marine, manufacturing, mobile telecoms, rail, retail and technology, 
Unipart offers a breadth of services from third party logistics to expert consultancy. 

Established more than 30 years ago, TTC has grown to become the leading independent 
brand in commercial vehicle parts and accessories in the UK and gained a well-earned 
reputation in the UK CV parts aftermarket for product quality, personal service and excellent 
product availability. TTC offers its customers the most comprehensive catalogue in the 
industry with product lines for the LCV, truck, trailer and PSV sectors, all easily accessible 
through a network of specialist CV parts distributors to all areas in the UK and Eire.


